
 

 

Item # Item Description Quantity Units
Suez Water Advanced 

Solutions                             

Elburn, IL

Municipal Well & Pump     

Waupun, WI

Great Lakes Water 

Resources Group             

Joliet, IL

Layne Christensen 

Company   Aurora, IL
Engineer's Estimate

A WELL PUMP AND MOTOR INSTALLATION @ WELL NO. 8

A1 1 LS

   

A2 Sunstar Motor Add/Deduct 1 LS
$297,403.00 $277,780.00 $293,000.00 NO BID $335,000.00

B WELL PUMP AND MOTOR INSTALLATION @ WELL NO. 9

B3 Sunstar Motor Add/Deduct 1 LS
$317,422.00 $278,250.00 $299,000.00 NO BID $345,000.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID $594,000.00 $700,000.00

$614,825.00 $556,030.00 $592,000.00 NO BID $680,000.00

$345,000.00NO BID NO BID no bid $296,000.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID $298,000.00

 

Total Base Bid

Total with Sunstar Motor

B1 1 LS

$355,000.00

Furnish and Install Well Pump, Pitless 

Adapter, Electric Cables, Discharge Column, 

Airline, w/Byron/Jackson Motor and 

Appurtenances. 

Furnish and Install Well Pump, Pitless 

Adapter, Electric Cables, Discharge Column, 

Airline, w/Byron/Jackson Motor and 

Appurtenances. 


