



VILLAGE OF
NORTH
AURORA
Crossroads on the Fox

**RESIDENTIAL
WASTE HAULER
RFP RESULTS**

ADVANCED DISPOSAL
PRICING PROPOSAL

Exhibit B – Pricing Proposal

1) Current Program

(Includes two clean-up day collections)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 (2)

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 3.65	\$19.50	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 3.76	\$20.10	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 3.87	\$20.70	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 3.99	\$21.30	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 4.10	\$21.95	4	4

2) Alternate Program #1

(Includes one clean-up day collection)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 (2)

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 3.65	\$19.50	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 3.76	\$20.10	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 3.87	\$20.70	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 3.99	\$21.30	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 4.10	\$21.95	4	4

Exhibit B – Pricing Proposal

3) Alternate Program #2

(Includes no clean-up day collections)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 (2)

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 3.55	\$19.50	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 3.66	\$20.10	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 3.77	\$20.70	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 3.88	\$21.30	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 3.99	\$21.95	4	4

4) Alternate Program #3

(Includes two clean-up day collections)

(Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 (2)

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 3.55	\$19.50	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 3.66	\$20.10	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 3.77	\$20.70	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 3.88	\$21.30	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 3.99	\$21.95	4	4

Exhibit B – Pricing Proposal

5) Alternate Program #4
(Includes one clean-up day collection)
(Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 3.55	\$19.50	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 3.66	\$20.10	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 3.77	\$20.70	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 3.88	\$21.30	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 3.99	\$21.95	4	4

6) Alternate Program #5
(Includes no clean-up day collections)
(Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 3.45	\$19.50	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 3.55	\$20.10	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 3.66	\$20.70	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 3.77	\$21.30	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 3.88	\$21.95	4	4

FLOOD BROTHERS DISPOSAL
PRICING PROPOSAL

Exhibit B – Pricing Proposal

1) Current Program

(Includes two clean-up day collections)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 5.25	\$21.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 5.40	\$21.60	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 5.55	\$21.90	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 5.68	\$22.30	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 5.75	\$22.70	4	4

2) Alternate Program #1

(Includes one clean-up day collection)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 5.15	\$21.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 5.30	\$21.60	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 5.45	\$21.90	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 5.55	\$22.30	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 5.65	\$22.70	4	4

Exhibit B – Pricing Proposal

3) Alternate Program #2

(Includes no clean-up day collections)
 (Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 4.45	\$21.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 4.75	\$21.35	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 4.95	\$21.65	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 5.15	\$21.75	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 5.35	\$21.85	4	4

4) Alternate Program #3

(Includes two clean-up day collections)
 (Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 5.00	\$21.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 5.20	\$21.60	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 5.30	\$21.90	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 5.40	\$22.30	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 5.40	\$22.70	4	4

"Fall Leaf sticker Only" - 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020
 \$2.25 \$2.25 \$2.30 \$2.35 \$2.40

Exhibit B – Pricing Proposal

5) Alternate Program #4

(Includes one clean-up day collection)

(Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 4.80	\$21.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 5.00	\$21.60	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 5.15	\$21.90	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 5.25	\$22.30	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 5.35	\$22.65	4	4

"Fall Leaf sticker Only" - 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020
 \$2.25 \$2.25 \$2.30 \$2.35 \$2.40

6) Alternate Program #5

(Includes no clean-up day collections)

(Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 4.45	\$21.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$ 4.65	\$21.35	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$ 4.80	\$21.50	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$ 5.00	\$21.95	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$ 5.15	\$22.10	4	4

"Fall Leaf sticker Only" - 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020
 \$2.20 \$2.20 \$2.25 \$2.30 \$2.35

GROOT INDUSTRIES

PRICING PROPOSAL

Exhibit B - Pricing Proposal

1) Current Program

(Includes two clean-up day collections)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 (2)

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$			
June 1, 2017	\$	NO BID		
June 1, 2018	\$			
June 1, 2019	\$			
June 1, 2020	\$			

2) Alternate Program #1

(Includes one clean-up day collection)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 (2)

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$			
June 1, 2017	\$	NO BID		
June 1, 2018	\$			
June 1, 2019	\$			
June 1, 2020	\$			

Exhibit B - Pricing Proposal

3) Alternate Program #2

(Includes no clean-up day collections)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 (2)

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$			
June 1, 2017	\$	NO BID		
June 1, 2018	\$			
June 1, 2019	\$			
June 1, 2020	\$			

4) Alternate Program #3

(Includes two clean-up day collections)

(Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) - 1 (2)

Collection Day(s) (circle) - Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$			
June 1, 2017	\$	NO BID		
June 1, 2018	\$			
June 1, 2019	\$			
June 1, 2020	\$			

Exhibit B – Pricing Proposal

5) Alternate Program #4

(Includes one clean-up day collection)

(Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 (2)

Collection Day(s) (circle) ~~Monday~~ Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 4.35	\$20.00	3	3
June 1, 2017	\$ 4.50	\$21.00	3	3
June 1, 2018	\$ 4.65	\$22.00	3	3
June 1, 2019	\$ 4.80	\$23.00	3	3
June 1, 2020	\$ 4.95	\$24.00	3	3

6) Alternate Program #5

(Includes no clean-up day collections)

(Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 (2)

Collection Day(s) (circle) ~~Monday~~ Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$ 4.20	\$20.00	3	3
June 1, 2017	\$ 4.35	\$21.00	3	3
June 1, 2018	\$ 4.50	\$22.00	3	3
June 1, 2019	\$ 4.65	\$23.00	3	3
June 1, 2020	\$ 4.80	\$24.00	3	3

REPUBLIC SERVICES

PRICING PROPOSAL

Exhibit B - Pricing Proposal

1) Current Program

(Includes two clean-up day collections)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 **2**

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday **Thursday Friday**

Monthly Base fee: \$5.25 every household June 1, 2016 3% increases each June 1

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$3.25	\$19.00	2	10
June 1, 2017	\$3.35	\$19.57	2	10
June 1, 2018	\$3.45	\$20.16	2	10
June 1, 2019	\$3.55	\$20.76	2	10
June 1, 2020	\$3.65	\$21.38	2	10

2) Alternate Program #1

(Includes one clean-up day collection)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$			
June 1, 2017	\$			
June 1, 2018	\$			
June 1, 2019	\$			
June 1, 2020	\$			

NO BID

Exhibit B - Pricing Proposal

3) Alternate Program #2

(Includes no clean-up day collections)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gal Refuse	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$			
June 1, 2017	\$			
June 1, 2018	\$			
June 1, 2019	\$			
June 1, 2020	\$			

NO BID

4) Alternate Program #3

(Includes two clean-up day collections)

(Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gal Refuse Total	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$			
June 1, 2017	\$			
June 1, 2018	\$			
June 1, 2019	\$			
June 1, 2020	\$			

NO BID

Exhibit B - Pricing Proposal

5) Alternate Program #4

(Includes one clean-up day collection)

(Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95 Gallon Refuse Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$			
June 1, 2017	\$			
June 1, 2018	\$			
June 1, 2019	\$			
June 1, 2020	\$			

NO BID

6) Alternate Program #5

(Includes no clean-up day collections)

(Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$			
June 1, 2017	\$			
June 1, 2018	\$			
June 1, 2019	\$			
June 1, 2020	\$			

NO BID

**WASTE MANAGEMENT
PRICING PROPOSAL**

Pricing

Exhibit B – Pricing Proposal

1) Current Program

(Includes two clean-up day collections)

(Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Total Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$3.61	\$23.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$3.71	\$23.64	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$3.81	\$24.30	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$3.92	\$24.98	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$4.03	\$25.68	4	4

2) Alternate Program #1 (includes one

clean-up day collection) (includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Total Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$3.55	\$23.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$3.65	\$23.64	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$3.75	\$24.30	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$3.86	\$24.98	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$3.97	\$25.68	4	4

Exhibit B – Pricing Proposal

3) Alternate Program #2 (Includes no clean-up day collections) (Includes the free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$3.30	\$23.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$3.39	\$23.64	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$3.48	\$24.30	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$3.58	\$24.98	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$3.68	\$25.68	4	4

4) Alternate Program #3 (Includes two clean-up day collections) (Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toter Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$3.58	\$23.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$3.68	\$23.64	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$3.78	\$24.30	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$3.89	\$24.98	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$4.00	\$25.68	4	4

Exhibit B – Pricing Proposal

5) Alternate Program #4 (Includes one clean-up day collection) (Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toler Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$3.52	\$23.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$3.62	\$23.64	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$3.72	\$24.30	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$3.82	\$24.96	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$3.93	\$25.66	4	4

6) Alternate Program #5 (Includes no clean-up day collections) (Includes no free fall leaf collection program)

of Collection Days (circle) – 1 2

Collection Day(s) (circle) – Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

	Refuse/Yard Waste Cost per Sticker	Monthly Flat Fee 95/96 Gallon Refuse Toler Service	# of Stickers per Bulk Item Heavier than 50 Pounds	# of Stickers per White Good Item Heavier than 50 Pounds
June 1, 2016	\$3.27	\$23.00	4	4
June 1, 2017	\$3.36	\$23.64	4	4
June 1, 2018	\$3.45	\$24.30	4	4
June 1, 2019	\$3.55	\$24.96	4	4
June 1, 2020	\$3.65	\$25.66	4	4